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Hoar Cross Hall

Nestled in the heart of the Staffordshire countryside, Hoar
Cross Hall offers a state-of-the-art spa, stylish bedrooms,
spectacular grounds and decadent dining

Hoar Cross Hall boasts an 85,000 sq. ft. spa, one of the
largest in Europe, holds 41 treatment rooms, 12 water
therapies, 6 heated rooms and endless relaxation areas.
Promising head-to-toe relaxation for both body and mind.

Brand-New Outdoor Spa Terrace, elevates your relaxation
to new heights, providing a serene escape like no other.  It
features 3 side-by-side Spa pools, 2 Monkey Brass Cold
Barrels, a Juniper Log Sauna, a Relaxation Room, Bar and
Lounge

Business event, fairytale wedding or maybe a big birthday
celebration, whatever the occasion, make This beautiful
stately home yours for a bespoke event you won’t forget!

Sprawling gardens and grounds are a treat to the eye,
pretty-as-a-picture rose garden, stunning water features
and perfectly manicured lawns

The Hall is surrounded by 40 acres of enchanting grounds
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Hoar Cross Hall

OVERVIEW

Nestled in the heart of thousands of acres of Staffordshire
countryside, enjoy delicious dining experiences to tantalise
your taste buds, woodland walks to invigorate your senses,
and a whole host of outdoor pursuits to add a touch of
excitement. Make this beautiful stately home exclusively
yours for your event or celebration. With private use of The
Ballroom, Henry’s Restaurant, Long Gallery, Joynes suite, 7
function rooms, grounds to the rear of the Hotel, and all
public areas of this 100,000 sq.ft Hall, you have the space
to be creative and develop the event of your dreams. 

Hoar Cross Hall becomes a blank canvas that is yours,
along with our support, to create a completely bespoke
event for a truly unforgettable occasion. Make yourself at
home within the elegant rooms and suites adorned with
luxuriant bedding, soft pillows, and stylish furnishings.
Serving the perfect blend of Jacobean architecture and
views of idyllic grounds, creating a picturesque backdrop
for your stay. From charming Garden View Rooms to
impressive Exclusive Suites and indulgent Hot Tub Suites,
where you can unwind in the bubbling warmth of your own
private sanctuary, prepare to be enveloped in a world of
comfort and elegance.
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Hoar Cross Hall

YOUR STAY

Number accommodated 

Accommodating a maximum of 200 guests across 104
bedrooms & suites. With cosy Country Rooms and
impressive Heritage Suites, there is plenty of space to
accommodate all your guests

From stylish furnishings to bold pops of colour, the venues
elegant rooms and suites compliment Hoar Cross Hall�s
Jacobean architecture and idyllic grounds

Bedrooms & Suites 

Prepare to be greeted by a vibrant, airy, and exceedingly
inviting ambiance as you step into the recently refurbished
rooms. The combination of appealing sofas, snug throws,
and a countryside-inspired interior creates an irresistible
space where you can unwind after your grand celebration
or event. Every aspect of your comfort has been
meticulously addressed, from the provision of superfast Wi-
Fi to the invigorating power shower that awaits you. Delight
in tastefully placed lighting and considerate finishing
touches that elevate the Hall’s rooms to a truly remarkable
level, ensuring that they become an unforgettable highlight
of your stay.

We do have a document which details the features of all
104 rooms & suites. Please do let us know if you would like a
detailed breakdown of each room to help with locating
your clients, colleagues or guests. 

Dining

The Ballroom - The AA Rosette-awarded Ballroom
restaurant provides an impeccable end to your day.
The award-winning Executive Chef prides his matching of
classic dishes with a contemporary twist. 

Hoar Cross Hall boasts an unrivalled collection of private
dining rooms, large ballrooms and grand suites! 

The Chapel - A truly unique feature room that lends well to
an intimate dining experience (seating 12)

The Halifax Suite - With a magnificent feature fireplace,
this magnificent room is a lovely space for private
dining (seating up to 30 theatre/20 banquet)

The Meynell Suite - It’s feature fireplace, original cornicing,
large bay window & high ceilings create a stunning
backdrop (seating 40 theatre/30 banquet)

The Library - The old library is one of the feature historic
rooms, mixing stylish contemporary furnishings against a
wonderful oak-panelled backdrop (seating 40 theatre/30
banquet)

The Ballroom - This striking feature room, with its ornate
ceiling and plasterwork, centre roses, grand chandeliers
and listed wallpaper has views over the perfectly
manicured gardens. A truly magnificent space that will give
your occasion grandeur (seating up to 100 banquet)

The Joynes Suite - The largest and most extravagant room.
The elegant and contemporary space is ideal for gala
dinners. This suite boasts its own private bar and a
generous lounge area  (seating 150 theatre/120 banquet)

Catering 

Using Hoar Cross Hall’s internationally recognised
Executive Chef to create a bespoke gastronomic journey,
tailored to your tastes. Utilising the talented kitchen team
and local sustainable suppliers, prepare to be blown away
with AA Rosette standard fine dining for your entire event
or celebration
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Hoar Cross Hall

YOUR STAY (cont.)

Wedding

Weddings at Hoar Cross Hall - Make this beautiful stately
home exclusively yours for your big day.
Boasting carefully landscaped gardens, 104 stylishly
designed bedrooms, and top-
notch Spa facilities, ensuring you have everything you
need when planning the day of your dreams. 

The Ceremony - If you�ve got your heart set on a religious
ceremony, the charming Church of the Holy Angels is right
on the doorstep. Keeping your nearest and dearest close,
ensuring a smooth transition from vows to venue. If you
prefer a personalised ceremony, then look no further than
the beautiful surroundings of the Ballroom or Private
Suites. The team promise a space that can be adapted to
create the dream setting for your one-of-a-kind day.

The Reception - Toast to the future with the blank canvas
of this spacious Hall to work with, prepare to tailor every
moment of your elegant reception, from the refreshing
arrival drinks and decadent wedding breakfast, to the
eclectic evening entertainment and delicious midnight
munchies.

The Food - Savour a private tasting and bespoke culinary
consultation with the Hall’s award-winning Executive Chef,
crafting your dream wedding menu together. Catering to
all dietary requirements, ages, and preferences,
the kitchen team will blow you away with their flavours and
flair. 

The Grounds - The sprawling gardens and grounds are a
true to treat to the eye. Make the most of the pretty-as-a-
picture rose garden, stunning water features, and perfectly
manicured lawns when capturing moments from your
special day. 

The Rooms - 104 stylish rooms that are perfect for friends
and family to unwind, before or after your big day. With
cosy Country Rooms, Heritage Suites and the infamous
Honeymoon Suite, there is plenty of space to
accommodate your growing guest list.

Corporate

Nestled in the heart of the picturesque Staffordshire
countryside, Hoar Cross Hall offers an elegant and
sophisticated venue for all occasions, from corporate
conferences to intimate social gatherings. This stunning
backdrop and exquisite venue provide the perfect setting
for your event.

Hoar Cross Hall understand that every event is unique,
that’s why they offer a range of packages that can be
tailored to your specific requirements. Whether you’re
planning a lavish gala dinner, a relaxing spa day, or a team-
building adventure, they have the expertise and resources
to create a truly unforgettable experience.

All event spaces are versatile, offering flexible seating
arrangements and state-of-the-art audio-visual
equipment. The stylish and comfortable bedrooms ensure
that your guests will enjoy a restful night’s sleep in
sumptuous beds and wake up to stunning views in tranquil
surroundings.

Check in & out times

Checking in form 3pm

Checking out by 11am

Pets

Hoar Cross Hall is not suitable for pets

Disabled facilities

There are two designated accessible bedrooms providing
24-hour pull cord assistance and assisted bathrooms, plus
a further five ground floor bedrooms suitable for limited
access. 

Wheelchair accessibility for entry to both the Hotel and the
day Spa.
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Hoar Cross Hall

ACTIVITIES

On-site activities 

85,000 sq. ft. spa, one of the largest in Europe, holds 41
treatment rooms, 12 water therapies, 6 heated rooms and
endless relaxation areas. Promising head-to-toe relaxation
for both body and mind, our state-of-the-art spa is an idyllic
escape for all. Talk to your event planner about costings
and building a spa experience into your event.

40 acres of enchanting grounds 

Outdoor Pursuits - Ignite your sense of adventure with an
array of invigorating activities at Hoar Cross Hall. Elevate
your game on the pristine tennis courts, embracing the
thrill of friendly competition, and unleash your inner golfer
as you master your drive on the driving range, honing your
skills amidst breathtaking surroundings. Practice your
precision and focus at the archery class, where skilled
instructors guide you through the art of hitting the mark.

Discover the beauty of nature as you stroll or pedal along
the picturesque woodland trail, immersing yourself in the
mesmerizing vistas of the Needwood Forest and the
majestic oaks that grace the estate. The tranquil Italian
Garden invites you to pause and appreciate the tranquillity
that surrounds you.

Team Building

Hoar Cross Hall understands the importance of boosting
morale and creativity within your business, and that’s why
they offer team building activities that are both fun and
effective. Working closely with professionals that have
created engaging and interactive options which can be
tailored to suit your business needs. With options of both
indoor and outdoor activities, from problem-solving
challenges to country pursuits, all set within the
Hall’s beautiful surroundings.

So, if you’re looking to boost morale, increase creativity,
and improve productivity within your business, look no
further than Hoar Cross Hall for your next team building
event.

Activities such as: Charity Bike Build, Crystal
Challenge, Dragons Lair, Quid Games, It�s a
Knockout, Escape Room, Teamopoly, Archery & Duck
Herding to name but a few. 

Local attractions

The Trentham Estate & Monkey Forest - Walk amongst 140
free roaming monkeys in one of Staffordshire’s most
ancient forests, followed by a stroll in the award-winning
gardens of the Trentham Estate!

Staffordshire’s Bluebell Woods - Staffordshire is blessed
with some of the best bluebell woods around! Why not set
out with a picnic from mid-April to late May, to discover
these beautiful flowers in full bloom!

Drayton Manor Theme Park - Drayton Manor Theme Park
is home to a variety of exciting attractions, from roller
coasters and zoos, to Thomas Land and crazy golf.

The Snowdome - Visit the UK’s first real snow activity venue
in Tamworth. Offering ice-skating, skiing, tubing,
snowboarding, tobogganing, snow play, swimming,
climbing, dining and so much more!

Alton Towers - Set in over 500 acres of beautiful
Staffordshire countryside, the Alton Towers Resort offers
world class rides, waterparks, gardens and events!

Local Golf Course - Kick-back in true country style, as you
practise your putting at one of Staffordshire’s many golf
courses. From Seedy Mill and The Belfry, to Branston or
Beau Desert, we promise there is a course for you!
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Hoar Cross Hall

LOCATION

Hoar Cross Hall is located within the heart of the
Staffordshire countryside. Set amid 50 acres of gardens on
an 1871 genteel Elizabethan estate, this upscale hotel and
spa is 8.8 miles from Rugeley Trent Valley train station and
9.3 miles from St. Thomas’s Priory Golf Course. Escape to
the country and savour fine food, soothe your senses with
tailored treatments, and relax in the award-winning spa.

Distance from

London: 2 hours 50 minutes / 135 miles

Birmingham: 50 minutes / 30 miles

Manchester: 1 hour 55 minutes / 64 miles

Nearest airport

Birmingham Airport: 45 minutes / 32 miles

Nearest train station

Burton-on-Trent: 8.4 miles

Uttoxeter: 10.6 miles

Lichfield City: 11.6 miles
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Hoar Cross Hall

PRICES

2024 / 2025

Exclusive use

To offer a guide, exclusive use starts from £45,000 per
night. This would include all 104 bedrooms, restaurants,
bars, and meeting spaces. The spa can be added
exclusively starting from £20,000. Minimum food &
beverage charges will apply on top and can be quoted
bespoke to your requirements.

Part exclusive use

Please do enquire for all part exclusive use bookings. Hoar
Cross Hall can provide a number of bedrooms that
suit your numbers, plus provide private dining & function
rooms if required 

Wedding

Please do enquire for all exclusive use packages &
bespoke proposals. Hoar Cross Hall are able to work this
superb Stately Home around each clients
requirements, therefore every proposal is unique!

Corporate

Please do enquire for all exclusive use & part exclusive use
bookings 

Day Delegate Option?

Mid-Morning - Coffee or Tea, homemade flapjacks & power
fruit smoothies

Lunchtime - Two course Lunch, Chefs� menu of the day

Afternoon Treats - Tea selection, freshly brewed coffee,
selection of mini milkshakes & mini cake selection

From £60 per person

24 Hour Meeting Option

All of the above, plus a delicious three-course dinner

Overnight accommodation in one of our comfortable
bedrooms with a full English breakfast in the morning to
kick start your day

Inclusive of full use of Equipment as required, Business
Stationery, Bottled Water, Cordial and Sweets on all tables,
Complimentary WI-FI, Complimentary on-site Parking,
Private Room

From £260 per person

Christmas & New Year

Please enquire for all festive packages 
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Hoar Cross Hall
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